
	

If You Don’t Walk They 
Won’t Listen 

Luke 12:1  

[1]In the mean time, when there were gathered together an innumerable multitude of 
people, insomuch that they trode one upon another, he began to say unto his disciples 
first of all, Beware ye of the leaven of the Pharisees, which is hypocrisy.  

G5272  

Original: ὑπόκρισις  

Transliteration: hupokrisis  

Phonetic: hoop-ok'-ree-sis  

Thayer Definition:  

the acting of a stage player  

dissimulation, hypocrisy  

Dissimulation: concealment of one's thoughts, feelings, or character; pretense  

Strong's Definition:  

From G5271; acting under a feigned part; that is, (figuratively) deceit (" hypocrisy" ): - 
condemnation, dissimulation, hypocrisy  

H2611  



	
 ,Original BDB Definition: hypocritical, alahayimless, profane, hypocrite: חנף
irreligious Strong's Definition: From H2610; soiled (that is, with sin), impious: - 
hypocrite (-ical)  

Romans 12:9  

[9]Let love be without dissimulation. Abhor that which is evil; cleave to that which is 
good.  

G505  

Original: ἀνυπόκριτος  

Transliteration: anupokritos  

Phonetic: an-oo-pok'-ree-tos  

Thayer Definition:  

unfeigned, undisguised, sincere  

Strong's Definition: From G1 (as a negative particle) and a presumed derivative of 
G5271; undissembled, that is, sincere: - without dissimulation (hypocrisy), unfeigned  

Luke 12:2-3 	

[2]For there is nothing covered, that shall not be revealed; neither hid, that shall not be 
known.  

[3]Therefore whatsoever ye have spoken in darkness shall be heard in the light; and that 
which ye have spoken in the ear in closets shall be proclaimed upon the housetops.  

Matthew 12:36-37  

[36]But I say unto you, That every idle word that men shall speak, they shall give 



	
account thereof in the day of judgment.  

[37]For by thy words thou shalt be justified, and by thy words thou shalt be condemned. 
Ecclesiasticus 1:29-30 	

[29]Be not an hypocrite in the sight of men, and take good heed what thou speakest.  

[30]Exalt not thyself, lest thou fall, and bring dishonour upon thy soul, and so Alahayim 
discover thy secrets, and cast thee down in the midst of the congregation, because thou 
camest not in truth to the fear of Ahayah, but thy heart is full of deceit.  

Proverbs 28:13  

[13]He that covereth his sins shall not prosper: but whoso confesseth and forsaketh 
them shall have mercy.  

Luke 6:39-40  

[39]And he spake a parable unto them, Can the blind lead the blind? shall they not both 
fall into the ditch?  

[40]The disciple is not above his master: but every one that is perfect shall be as his 
master.  

Matthew 7:3-5  

[3]And why beholdest thou the mote that is in thy brother's eye, but considerest not the 
beam that is in thine own eye?  

[4]Or how wilt thou say to thy brother, Let me pull out the mote out of thine eye; and, 
behold, a beam is in thine own eye?  

[5]Thou hypocrite, first cast out the beam out of thine own eye; and then shalt thou see 
clearly to cast out the mote out of thy brother's eye.  



	
1 Corinthians 1:8,17  

[8]Who shall also confirm you unto the end, that ye may be blameless in the day of our 
Lord Yache Christ.  

[17]For Christ sent me not to baptize, but to preach the gospel: not with wisdom of 
words, lest the cross of Christ should be made of none effect.  

1 Corinthians 2:4-5 

 [4]And my speech and my preaching was not with enticing words of man's wisdom, but 
in demonstration of the Spirit and of power:  

[5]That your faith should not stand in the wisdom of men, but in the power of Alahayim.  

1 Corinthians 13:4-8,13 

1Co 13:4   

Charity suffereth long, and is kind; charity envieth not; charity vaunteth not itself, is not 
puffed up, 

1Co 13:5   

Doth not behave itself unseemly, seeketh not her own, is not easily provoked, thinketh 
no evil; 

1Co 13:6   

Rejoiceth not in iniquity, but rejoiceth in the truth; 

1Co 13:7   

Beareth all things, believeth all things, hopeth all things, endureth all things. 

 [8]Charity never faileth: but whether there be prophecies, they shall fail; whether there 
be tongues, they shall cease; whether there be knowledge, it shall vanish away.  

[13]And now abideth faith, hope, charity, these three; but the greatest of these is charity.  



	
 1 John 4:8 	

[8]He that loveth not knoweth not Alahayim; for Alahayim is love. 	

1 Timothy 1:5  

[5]Now the end of the commandment is charity out of a pure heart, and of a good 
conscience, and of faith unfeigned:  

Romans 13:8-10 	

[8]Owe no man any thing, but to love one another: for he that loveth another hath 
fulfilled the law.  

[9]For this, Thou shalt not commit adultery, Thou shalt not kill, Thou shalt not steal, 
Thou shalt not bear false witness, Thou shalt not covet; and if there be any other 
commandment, it is briefly comprehended in this saying, namely, Thou shalt love thy 
neighbour as thyself.  

[10]Love worketh no ill to his neighbour: therefore love is the fulfilling of the law.  

Ecclesiasticus 28:25-26 

[25]And weigh thy words in a balance, and make a door and bar for thy mouth. 
[26]Beware thou slide not by it, lest thou fall before him that lieth in wait.  

Ecclesiasticus 8:10-11  

[10]Kindle not the coals of a sinner, lest thou be burnt with the flame of his fire.  

[11]Rise not up in anger at the presence of an injurious person, lest he lie in wait to 
entrap thee in thy words  

Proverbs 11:9  



	
[9]An hypocrite with his mouth destroyeth his neighbour: but through knowledge shall 
the just be delivered.  

Proverbs 25:26  

[26]A righteous man falling down before the wicked is as a troubled fountain, and a 
corrupt spring.  

Wisdom of Solomon 2:12-19  

[12]Therefore let us lie in wait for the righteous; because he is not for our turn, and he is 
clean contrary to our doings: he upbraideth us with our offending the law, and objecteth 
to our infamy the transgressings of our education.  

[13]He professeth to have the knowledge of Alahayim: and he calleth himself the child of 
Ahayah.  

[14]He was made to reprove our thoughts.  

[15]He is grievous unto us even to behold: for his life is not like other men's, his ways 
are of another fashion.  

[16]We are esteemed of him as counterfeits: he abstaineth from our ways as from 
filthiness: he pronounceth the end of the just to be blessed, and maketh his boast that 
Alahayim is his father.  

[17]Let us see if his words be true: and let us prove what shall happen in the end of him.  

[18]For if the just man be the son of Alahayim, he will help him, and deliver him from 
the hand of his enemies.  

[19]Let us examine him with despitefulness and torture, that we may know his 
meekness, and prove his patience.  



	
James 1:26  

[26]If any man among you seem to be religious, and bridleth not his tongue, but 
deceiveth his own heart, this man's religion is vain.  

Colossians 4:5-6 	

[5]Walk in wisdom toward them that are without, redeeming the time.  

[6]Let your speech be alway with grace, seasoned with salt, that ye may know how ye 
ought to answer every man.  

Ecclesiasticus 1:28-29  

[28]Distrust not the fear of Ahayah when thou art poor: and come not unto him with a 
double heart.  

[29]Be not an hypocrite in the sight of men, and take good heed what thou speakest.  

Psalms 51:10-13 

 [10]Create in me a clean heart, O Alahayim; and renew a right spirit within me. 
[11]Cast me not away from thy presence; and take not thy holy spirit from me. 
[12]Restore unto me the joy of thy salvation; and uphold me with thy free spirit. 
[13]Then will I teach transgressors thy ways; and sinners shall be converted unto thee.  

  


